
MATERIAL BIDS FOR 2022

The following bidders were present:  Cadillac Culvert, St. Regis Culvert and Jensen Bridge & Supply Co.

MOTOR OIL AND HYDRAULIC OIL
								
The Lyden Oil Company			Engine Oil		$8.29 gal.	
60 Days Effective April 1, 2022		Hydraulic Oil		$6.25 gal.

Rowley’s					Engine Oil		$8.86 gal
60 Days Effective April 1, 2022		Hydraulic Oil		$6.78 gal

Blarney Castle				Engine Oil		$5.95gal
90 Days Effective April 1, 2022		Hydraulic Oil		$3.99 gal

Major Brands Oil Company		Engine Oil		$7.96 gal
180 Days Effective April 1, 2022		Hydraulic Oil		$5.91 gal

Crystal Flash Inc.				Engine Oil		$9.79 gal
60  Days Effective April 1, 2022		Hydraulic Oil		$7.79 gal
		

GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL
All Bidders will be placed on file for ‘Spot Bid’ purposes.
		
Petroleum Traders			Unleaded Gasoline	
					 Diesel 				
					
Brenner Oil				Unleaded Gasoline 	   
					Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel 

Blarney Castle			Unleaded Gasoline	
					Diesel			

Crystal Flash				Unleaded Gasoline
					Diesel




CORRUGATED DUAL WALL PIPE MATERIAL

Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS) 			12”	            $ 7.69 LFT	
								15”		$ 9.42	LFT 	
								18”	            $13.67	LFT	
								24”	            $23.07	LFT	









CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS					Galv		ALT2

St. Regis Culvert				
Prices firm for 30 days beginning April 1, 2022
[bookmark: _Hlk96520642]16 Gauge	12”	            $10.90		$15.00
								15”		$13.08		$18.00
								18”	            $16.35		$22.50
						14 Gauge	24”	            $26.40		$36.00

Cadillac Culvert				
Prices firm for 60 days beginning April 1, 2022
16 Gauge	12”		$10.35		$13.20	
15”		$12.25		$16.30			18”		$14.75		$19.55
						14 Gauge	24”	            $27.45		$34.00

Jensen Bridge & Supply Company		
Prices firm until April 25, 2022
						16 Gauge	12”		$10.43		$12.19											15”		$12.82		$15.20
								18’		$15.57		$18.30
						14 Gauge	24”		$25.30  	$30.60		                                                       
		
							
GUARD RAIL & POSTS	
			
Jenson Bridge & Supply Company			      
Prices firm for 90 days beginning April 01, 2022	        	
Straight Rail   	 	$ 13.26   per lineal ft.	
  Wood Post		$ 93.41 each (6”x8”x7’)
    Steel Post		$ 72.06 each (6”x8.5#x6’)
					      Buffered End Assembly          	$700.00 each
							        Curved		$  27.50  per lineal ft
				        Guardrail Approach Terminal             	$3,000.00 each
					  Guard Rail Blocks (wood)		$  23.75


BRIDGE MATERIALS

Krenn Timber Bridge Inc
Prices Firm for 365 Days		Treated SYP Bridge Planking		$5,369.45/MBM
			        Timber Box Culvert & Transverse Deck  	$8,027.37/MBM
						    Transverse Decking	$8,874.93/MBM
			         Treated Bridge & Salt Storage Timbers	     	$7,279.43/MBM





COLD PATCH MATERIAL
Unique Paving			CP-6 Bidders Yard	 No Bid
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	 No Bid 
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	$ 92.00 per ton
					CP-7 MCRC Yard      $112.48 per ton

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.		CP-6 Bidders Yard	 No Bid
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	 No Bid
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	$ 90.00
					CP-7 MCRC Yard      $107.00 per ton

Asphalt Paving Inc.			CP-6 Bidders Yard	$115.00
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	 No Bid
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	 No Bid
					CP-7 MCRC Yard	 No Bid


Rieth-Riley Const.			CP-6 Bidders Yard	 No Bid
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	 No Bid
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	$106.00
					CP-7 MCRC Yard	$112.00



HMA ASPHALT PAVING MATERIAL
Asphalt Paving, Muskegon		HMA Surface Mixture 		$74.50 per ton
					HMA Leveling/Base Mixture	    	$74.50 per ton 

Rieth Riley Construction Co Inc.	HMA Surface Mixture		$71.50 per ton
					HMA Leveling/Base Mixture		$70.50 per ton
					HMA Flow Boa			$185.00 per hr.

EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATES 
Equipment Rental Rates will be placed on file for the lowest responsive Bidder:  There was only one bidder, Petersen & Sons  L.L.C  


