
MATERIAL BIDS FOR 2020
The following bidders were present:  Cadillac Culvert, St. Regis Culvert and Jensen Bridge & Supply Co.

MOTOR OIL AND HYDRAULIC OIL								
The Lyden Oil Company			Engine Oil		$5.65 gal.	
90 Days Effective April 1, 2020		Hydraulic Oil		$3.78 gal.

Rowley’s					Engine Oil		$5.75 gal
60 Days Effective April 1, 2020		Hydraulic Oil		$3.99 gal

Blarney Castle				Engine Oil		$5.95 gal
90 Days Effective April 1, 2020		Hydraulic Oil		$3.99 gal

Merle Boes
180 Days Effective April 1, 2020		Engine Oil		$5.65 gal
						Hydraulic Oil		$3.87 gal
GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL
All Bids are at cost over rack price.		
Petroleum Traders			Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.0239
					 Diesel 		Marathon	0.0231			
					
Brenner Oil				Unleaded Gasoline 	   Valero	0.0495
					Ultra-Low Sulfur Diesel Valero	0.0495	

Blarney Castle			Unleaded Gasoline	Luke Oil	.05
					Diesel			Luke Oil	.06

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS
St Regis Culvert				16 Gauge	12”	            $5.75
Prices firm for 60 days beginning April 1, 2020		15”		  6.85
								18”	              8.48
						14 Guage	24”	            13.85

Cadillac Culvert				16 Gauge	12”		$5.65
Prices firm for 120 days beginning April 1, 2020		15”		  6.70													18”		  8.35
						14 Gauge	24”	            10.80

Jensen Bridge & Supply Company		16 Gauge	12”		$5.62
Prices firm for 60 days beginning April 1, 2020		15”		  6.71
								18’		  8.32
						14 Gauge	24”		13.62	  

Ferguson Enterprises LLC			16 Gauge	12”		$6.88
Prices firm for 60 days beginning April 1, 2020		15”		  8.29
								18’		10.33
						14 Gauge	24”		16.48		


Core & Main					16 Guage	12”		$6.57
Prices firm for 90 days from date of bid			15”		  9.65
								18’		11.36
						14 Guage	24”		20.93			                                                       

EQUIPMENT RENTAL RATES 
Opened on February 26, 2020 will be placed on file for the lowest responsive Bidder:  CIS Snow Plowing and Excavating Inc., Ludington, Petersen & Sons, Pentwater, Hallack Contracting, Hart.    
									
GUARD RAIL & POSTS				
Jenson Bridge & Supply Company			Straight Rail		$   6.17 per lineal ft.	
Prices firm for 120 days beginning April 01, 2020	Wood Post		   57.65 each (6”x8”x7’)	
Steel Post		   44.00 each (6”x8.5#x6’)
						Buffered End Assembly          115.29 each
							Curved			   11.00 per lineal ft
					Guardrail Approach Terminal          1,646.67 each

BRIDGE MATERIALS
Krenn Timber Bridge Inc
Prices Firm for 365 Days		Treated SYP Bridge Planking		       $4,446.75/MBM
				            Timber Box Culvert & Transverse Deck    6,647.92/MBM
					Transverse Decking			         7,349.84/MBM
					Treated Bridge & Salt Storage Timbers      6,028.52/MBM

COLD PATCH MATERIAL
Unique Paving			CP-6 Bidders Yard	No Bid
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid 
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	 $90.00 per ton
					CP-7 MCRC Yard      $108.84 per ton

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.		CP-6 Bidders Yard	 No Bid
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	 No Bid
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	 $90.00 per ton
					CP-7 MCRC Yard      $102.00 per ton

Asphalt Paving Inc.			CP-6 Bidders Yard	$110.00
					CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid
					CP-7 Bidders Yard	No Bid
					CP-7 MCRC Yard	No Bid

HMA ASPHALT PAVING MATERIAL
Asphalt Paving, Muskegon		HMA Surface Mixture 		$70.00 per ton
					HMA Leveling/Base Mixture	    	$69.00 per ton 

Rieth Riley Construction Co Inc.	HMA Leveling Mixture		$68.00 per ton
					HMA Leveling/Base Mixture		$68.00 per ton
					HMA Flow Boa			$175.00 per hr.
Molon Asphalt, Inc.			HMA Leveling Mixture		$70.00 per ton
					HMA Leveling/Base Mixture		$70.00 per ton
					HMA Flow Boa			$120.00 per hr.

2020 Equipment Rental Rates.
Bidders included:
CIS Snow Plowing and Excavating Inc., Ludington
Hallack Contracting, Hart
Petersen & Sons, Pentwater
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