

**Material Bids for 2013**

The following bidders were present: Randy Orr-Jensen Bridge, Ron Alexander of Alexander Sand & Gravel, John White of White Trucking, Bob Conrad of Beckman Production Services, Don Aldrich of Cadillac Culvert and Brian Schultz of Schultz Excavating.

**MOTOR OIL AND HYDRAULIC OIL**

<b>Lyden Oil</b>	Engine Oil	\$6.95 gal.
120 days	Hydraulic Oil	5.85 gal.
<b>Blarney Castle</b>	Engine Oil	\$7.02 gal.
90 Days	Hydraulic Oil	5.61 gal.
<b>J &amp; H Oil Company</b>	Engine Oil	\$8.96 gal.
30 Days	Hydraulic Oil	7.191 gal.
<b>North Central Co-op</b>	Engine Oil	\$10.47 gal.
180 Days	Hydraulic Oil	8.35 gal.

**GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL**

**All Bids are at cost over rack price.**

<b>J &amp; H Oil Company</b>	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.06236
	Diesel	Marathon	0.05915
<b>Petroleum Traders</b>	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.027
	Diesel	Marathon	0.027
<b>North Central Co-op</b>	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.0838
	Diesel	Marathon	0.0848
<b>Scotland Oil Co Inc.</b>	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.0400
	Diesel	Marathon	0.0400
<b>Blarney Castle Oil Co.</b>	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.04575
	Diesel	Marathon	0.05165
<b>RKA Petroleum Companies Inc</b>	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.0716
	Diesel	Marathon	0.0716

<b>Brenner Oil</b>	Unleaded Gasoline Valero	0.0295
	Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel Valero	0.0295

### CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS

<b>Jensen Bridge &amp; Supply</b>	16 Gauge	12"	\$5.40
Prices firm for 90 days Beginning May 1, 2013		15"	6.50
		18"	8.25
		24"	10.50

<b>Contech</b>	16 Gauge	12"	\$6.20
Prices firm for 365 days beginning May 1, 2013		15"	7.44
		18"	9.30
		24"	14.88

<b>Advanced Drainage Systems (ADS)</b>	Plastic	12"	\$5.11
Prices firm for 365 days beginning May 1, 2013		15"	6.85
		18"	9.75
		24"	16.25

<b>St Regis Culvert</b>	16 Gauge	12"	\$5.45
Prices firm for 90 days beginning May 1, 2013		15"	6.55
		18"	8.28
		24"	10.75

<b>Cadillac Culvert</b>	16 Gauge	12"	\$5.38
Prices firm for 90 days beginning May 1, 2013		15"	6.42
		18"	8.23
		24"	10.39

### GUARD RAIL & POSTS

#### **Jensen Bridge**

Prices firm for 90 days beginning April 01, 2013	Straight Rail	\$ 5.71 per lineal ft.
	Wood Post	53.10 each
	Steel Post	44.29 each
	Buffered End Assembly	128.57 each
	Curved	9.71 per lineal ft.

**COLD PATCH MATERIAL**

<b>Rieth Riley</b>	CP-6 Bidders Yard	No Bid	
	CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid	
	CP-7 Bidders Yard	\$90.00 per ton	
	CP-7MCRC Yard	\$94.00 per ton	
<b>Unique Paving</b>	CP-6 Bidders Yard	No Bid per ton	
	CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid per ton	
	CP-7 Bidders Yard	\$85.50 per ton	
	CP-7 MCRC Yard	\$102.15 per ton	
<b>Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.</b>	CP-6 Bidders Yard	\$85.00 per ton	
	CP-6 MCRC Yard	\$94.34 per ton	
	CP-7 Bidders Yard	\$90.00 per ton	
	CP-7 MCRC Yard	\$102.82 per ton	

**BRINE CALCIUM CHLORIDE**

<b>Michigan Chloride Sales</b>	Bidders Yard Brine	25%	.070
	Furnished & Applied Continuously	25%	.196
	Furnished & Applied Intermittently	25%	.226
	Furnished & loaded in storage facility	25%	.186
<b>Beckman Production Services</b>	Bidders Yard Brine	25%	.08
	Furnished & Applied Continuously	25%	.139
	Furnished & Applied Intermittently	25%	.149
	Furnished & loaded in storage facility	25%	.135
<b>White Truck Line LLC</b>	Bidders Yard Brine	25%	.145
	Furnished & Applied Continuously	25%	.145
	Furnished & Applied Intermittently	25%	.145
	Furnished & loaded in storage facility	25%	.125
	Furnish Storage Facilities	25%	.135

**PROCESSED AGGREGATE (GRAVEL) MATERIAL**

<b>Bidder</b>	<b>25,000 cubic yards</b>		
<b>Alexander Sand &amp; Gravel</b>	Delivered FOB Scottville	No Bid	per ton
	Processed gravel/Suppliers yard	\$ 4.50	per cubic yard
	Processing in MCRC pit (Irons)	No Bid	per ton
	Gravel Material in Suppliers pit	\$3.00	per ton
	10,000 cy Ice control sand material	\$2.53	per cubic yard
	Specify location	Irons Pit, Brooks Rd & 9 mile	

**12,500 Ton**

**Schultz Excavating**

Delivered FOB Scottville	No Bid	per ton
Processed gravel/Suppliers yard	\$ 8.45	per ton
Loaded and scaled at their Ludington yard		
Processing in MCRC pit (Irons)	No Bid	per ton
Material in Suppliers pit	No Bid	per ton
Ice control sand material	No Bid	per cubic yard
30,000 tons available in fenced yard with lock for \$8.45 per ton.		

**Ken Adams Excavating****25,000 Cubic Yards**

Delivered FOB Scottville	\$10.00	per ton
Processed gravel/Suppliers yard	\$10.00	per cubic yard
Processing in MCRC pit (Irons)	\$ 3.00	per ton
Material in Suppliers pit	\$ 8.00	per ton
Ice control sand material	\$ 1.75	per ton
Specify location Ice Control sand	\$ 2.50 per ton	Peters Pit

**MCRC Irons Pit****Jeff Riggs****25,000 Cubic Yards**

Delivered FOB Scottville	No Bid	per ton
Processed gravel/Suppliers yard	\$ 6.10	per cubic yard
Processing in MCRC pit (Irons)	No Bid	per ton
Material in Suppliers pit	No Bid	per ton
Ice control sand material	\$ 1.75	per ton
Specify location Section 3	Elk Township	

**Halliday Sand & Gravel****25,000 Cubic Yards**

Delivered FOB Scottville	\$ 7.75	per ton
Processed gravel/Suppliers yard	\$ 5.50	per cubic yard
Processing in MCRC pit (Irons)	\$ 3.20	per ton
Material in Suppliers pit	No Bid	per ton
Ice control sand material	\$ 1.50	per ton
Specify location Steve's and Nugent Pit		

**Rieth Riley****By the Ton 22A**

Delivered FOB Scottville	\$10.20	per ton
Processed gravel/Suppliers yard	No Bid	per cubic yard
Processing in MCRC pit (Irons)	No Bid	per ton
Material in Suppliers pit	\$ 9.90	per ton
Ice control sand material	No Bid	per ton
Specify location Rieth Riley Ludington Yard		

**HMA Surfacing****Elmer's**

Remove HMA Surface	SYD	\$ 20.00
Temporary Pavement. Marking	LFT	\$ 2.00
HMA Mix 0-50	Ton	\$150.00
HMA Mix 51-100	Ton	\$125.00
HMA Mix 100-200	Ton	\$100.00

**Rieth Riley**

Remove HMA Surface	SYD	\$ 11.00
Temporary Pavement. Marking	LFT	\$ 1.00
HMA Mix 0-50	Ton	\$111.79
HMA Mix 51-100	Ton	\$ 79.00
HMA Mix 100-200	Ton	\$ 63.30

2013 Equipment Rental Rates will be placed on file. Bidders included:  
 CIS Snow Plowing and Excavating Inc  
 Ken Adams Excavating Inc.  
 Schultz Excavating