

Material Bids for 2018

The following bidders were present: Cadillac Culvert and St. Regis Culvert.

MOTOR OIL AND HYDRAULIC OIL

The Lyden Oil Company	Engine Oil	\$ 6.29 gal.
90 Days Effective April 1, 2018	Hydraulic Oil	4.43 gal.
Great Lakes Lubricants	Engine Oil	\$5.99 gal.
90 Days Effective April 1, 2018	Hydraulic Oil	\$3.69 gal.
Rowley's	Engine Oil	\$6.38 gal
180 Days Effective April 1, 2018	Hydraulic Oil	\$4.31 gal
Blarney Castle	Engine Oil	\$7.07 gal
365 Days Effective April 1, 2018	Hydraulic Oil	\$5.27 gal

GASOLINE AND DIESEL FUEL

All Bids are at cost over rack price.

Petroleum Traders	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	0.01
	Diesel	Marathon	0.01
Brenner Oil	Unleaded Gasoline	Valero	0.0495
	Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel	Valero	0.0495
Blarney Castle	Unleaded Gasoline	Luke Oil	.045
	Diesel	Luke Oil	.0525
Crystal Flash	Unleaded Gasoline	Marathon	.00591
	Diesel #2 Ultra	Marathon	.0620
	Diesel #2 Ultra	Winterized	.0665

CORRUGATED METAL CULVERTS

St Regis Culvert	16 Gauge	12"	\$6.89
Prices firm for 30 days beginning April 1, 2018		15"	8.35
		18"	10.45
		24"	14.08
Cadillac Culvert	16 Gauge	12"	\$6.24
Prices firm for 60 days beginning April 1, 2018		15"	7.49
		18"	9.10
		24"	11.70
Contech	16 Gauge	12"	\$6.98
Prices firm for 120 days beginning April 1, 2018		15"	8.85
		18"	11.05
		24"	14.25

GUARD RAIL & POSTS

Action Traffic Maintenance

	Straight Rail	\$ 6.35 per lineal ft.
	Wood Post	47.00 each
Prices firm for 240 days beginning April 01, 2018	Steel Post	36.50 each
	Buffered End Assembly	82.00 each
	Curved	7.65 per lineal ft
	Guardrail Approach Terminal	1,525.00 each

Bridge Materials

Krenn Timber Bridge Inc

Prices Firm for 365 Days

Treated SYP Bridge Planking	\$3,850.00/MBM
Timber Box Culvert & Transverse Deck	\$5,755.75/MBM
Transverse Decking	\$6,363.50/MBM
Treated Bridge & Salt Storage Timbers	\$5,219.50/MBM

COLD PATCH MATERIAL

Rieth Riley

CP-6 Bidders Yard	No Bid
CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid
CP-7 Bidders Yard	\$ 98.00 per ton
CP-7MCRC Yard	\$103.00 per ton

Unique Paving

CP-6 Bidders Yard	No Bid per ton
CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid per ton
CP-7 Bidders Yard	\$89.00 per ton
CP-7 MCRC Yard	\$108.20 per ton

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co.

CP-6 Bidders Yard	No Bid
CP-6 MCRC Yard	No Bid
CP-7 Bidders Yard	90.00 per ton
CP-7 MCRC Yard	100.00 per ton

2018 Equipment Rental Rates opened on March 20, 2018 will be placed on file for the lowest responsive Bidder:

CIS Snow Plowing and Excavating Inc., Ludington. Bulldog Unlimited, Custer
Hallack Contracting, Hart

Award Material Bids

Motion by Matiash and seconded by Schwass to award material bids as recommended by the staff to the lowest responsive bidder:

Motor Oil and Hydraulic Oil to all bidders, Rowley's, The Lyden Oil Company, Great Lakes Lubricants and Blarney Castle.

Gasoline and Diesel to all bidders, Brenner Oil, Petroleum Traders, Blarney Castle and Crystal Flash.

Corrugated Metal Culverts to all bidders and place on file. St Regis Culvert , Cadillac Culvert and Contech.

Guard Rail & Posts to Action Traffic Maintenance.

Bridge Materials to Krenn Timber Bridge Inc.

Ayes all. Motion carried.

2018 Cold Patch Material

Motion by Matiash seconded by Schwass to award the bid for cold patch material to Unique Paving, Reith Riley and Ace-Saginaw Paving Company or to the lowest responsive bidder. Ayes all. Motion carried.

2018 Equipment Rental Rates .

Bidders included:

CIS Snow Plowing and Excavating Inc., Ludington

Hallack Contracting, Hart

Bulldog Unlimited, Custer

Motion by Matiash seconded by Schwass to accept the bids for Equipment Rental Rates and place on file for the lowest responsive bidder. Ayes all. Motion carried.