

**At the regularly scheduled meeting of the Mason County Road Commission of March 8, 2018: Motion made by Schwass seconded by Matiash to award the bid for Gravel and Ice Control Sand as recommended by staff to Halliday Sand & Gravel for 25,000 cyds of gravel @ \$6.50 per cyd in suppliers pit and 10,000 cyds of ice control sand @ \$3.00 per cyd in the suppliers pit located at the Alexander Pit in Irons. Ayes all. Motion carried.**

Gravel Bids were opened on March 7, 2018 at 11:00 am.

**Rieth Riley Construction - 22A/23A (MDOT)**

Gravel-Delivered to Scottville	\$13.65 Per Ton
Suppliers Pit-Gravel	\$14.65 Per Ton
Processing in MCRC Pit-(Irons)	\$ No Bid
Ice Control Sand-Delivered to Scottville	\$ No Bid
Suppliers Pit-Ice Control Sand	\$ No Bid
Process Ice Control Sand in Irons Pit	\$ No Bid
Suppliers pit Ludington Plant	

**Halliday Sand & Gravel- 25,000 Cyds Gravel & 10,000 Cyds of Sand**

Gravel-Delivered to Scottville	\$ No Bid
Suppliers Pit-Gravel	\$ 6.50 per cubic yard
Processing in MCRC Pit-Irons	\$ No Bid
Ice Control Sand-Delivered to Scottville	\$ No Bid
Suppliers Pit-Ice Control Sand	\$ 3.00 per cubic yard
Process Ice Control Sand in Irons Pit	\$ No Bid
Suppliers pit is Alexander Pit, Irons	

**Schultz Excavating- 10,000 Ton Recycled Crushed Material**

Gravel-Delivered to Scottville	\$ No Bid
Suppliers Pit-Crushed Material	\$ 9.00 per ton 5,000 Ton minimum
Processing in MCRC Pit-Irons	\$ No Bid
Ice Control Sand-Delivered to Scottville	\$ No Bid
Suppliers Pit-Ice Control Sand	\$ No Bid
Process Ice Control Sand in Irons Pit	\$ No Bid
Suppliers pit 925 E Melendy St Ludington	

**Green Dream International- 37,500 Ton Gravel & 15,000 Ton Ice Control Sand**

Gravel-Delivered to Scottville	\$ 11.03 per Ton
Suppliers Pit-Gravel	\$ No Bid
Processing in MCRC Pit-Irons	\$ No Bid
Ice Control Sand-Delivered to Scottville	\$ 8.93 per Ton
Suppliers Pit-Ice Control Sand	\$ No Bid
Process Ice Control Sand in Irons Pit	\$ No Bid
Suppliers pit 925 E Melendy St Ludington	

**Ken Adams Excavating- 25,000 Cyds Gravel & 10,000 Cyds of Sand**

Gravel-Delivered to Scottville	\$ 10.50 Per Ton
Suppliers Pit-Gravel	\$ 9.75 per cubic yard
Processing in MCRC Pit-Irons	\$ 4.10 per ton
Ice Control Sand-Delivered to Scottville	\$ 8.50 per Ton
Suppliers Pit-Ice Control Sand	\$ 6.75 per cubic yard
Process Ice Control Sand in Irons Pit	\$ 3.00 per Ton
Suppliers pit / Groth Rd/When Available	

Only Mason County Road Commission/Ken Adams Excavating trucks will be allowed to haul out of the Peters Pit.